
Purchasing ,Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-4130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 151811

Solicitation Description: STONE, AGGREGATE AND CINDERS - MAT & DEL TO NON-EST LOCS

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version

2015-11-10 SR 0803 ESR10281500000001784 1
13:00:00

YENDOR

000000200683

CENTRAL SUPPLY CO.OF WV

FOR INFORMATIONCONTACTTHE BUYER
Angela Moorman
(304) 558-9427
angie.j.moorman@wv.gov

Signature X FEIN #
Ali offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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FORM tD : WV-PRC-5R-001

mailto:angie.j.moorman@wv.gov


Line CommLn Desc

STONE, AGGREGATE AND
CINDERS - MAT & DEL TO

Qty

0.00000

Unit Issue Unit Price

TON $0.000000
Ln Total Or Contract Amount
$0.00

CommCode Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Extended Description: STONE, AGGREGATE AND CINDERS - MAT & DEL TO NON-EST LOCS
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Pricing Page VENDOR NAME Central Supply Company of WV

Material and delivery by the Vendor to Non-Established WVDOH locations, ONLY.

Bid Price per Ton Items A-Wand AA
F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site

Limestone,
Contract Sandstone, Blast Furnace
Item Description of Material Gravel, Sand Slag Steel Slag
A Class 1 Aggregate 23.95
B Class 2 Aggregate 23.95
C Class 10 Aggregate 23.45
D AASHTO #1 Aggregate 24.15
E AASHTO #3 Aggregate 24.15
F AASHTO #4 Aggregate 24.40
G AASHTO #467 Aggregate 24.70
H AASHTO #57 Aggregate 25.20
I AASHTO #67 Aggregate no bid
J AASHTO #7 Aggregate no bid
K AASHTO #8 Aggregate 24.45
L AASHTO #9 Aggregate 25.70
M Stone for Gabions 24.70
N Fine Aggregate 24.70
OA Limestone Standard Abrasives 24.70
OB Sandstone Standard Abrasives no bid
PA Limestone Modified Abrasives 24.45
PB Sandstone Modified Abrasives no bid
Q Rip Rap 24.70
R Shot Rock 25.70
S AASHTO #8 Modified no bid
T AASHTO #9 Modified no bid
U Pea Gravel no bid
V #11 Limestone Abrasives no bid
W Quarry Waste 19.90

AA Cinders no bid

Items A-Wand AA (Except for Q and R):
Xl Haul by Vendor - First Ton-Mile 2.00
X2 Haul by Vendor - Additional Ton-Mile 0.20

Items Q and R ONLY:
Y1 Haul by Vendor - First Ton-Mile 2.50
Y2 Haul by Vendor - Additional Ton-Mile 0.25



INFORMATION ATTACHMENT
Vendor's Storage Sites

2015/2016 Stone and Aggregate - Materials and Delivery by Vendor to Non-Established WVDOH Locations

VENDOR NAME _

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.
A Vendor may submit more than one Vendor's Storage Sites information on one Information Attachment form
ONLY if bid pricing is the SAME for all Storage Sites and all WVDOH locations bid. A separate bid submission
and Information Attachment form MUST be submitted when bid price varies between Vendor's Storage Sites.

Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel, Sand, Blast Furnance Slag and Steel Slag

a) SOURCE OF MATERIAL (gll sources for which bid prices apply (e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone
or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag)

Kelly Mountain Quarry - location RT 33 Kelly Mountain Road

b) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S): A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

Linn Stone - location County Highway 47 West, Linn WV 26384

Cinders

c) SOURCE OF MATERIAL: Name and Location of plant which produces Cinder material.
No bid

d) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S) A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

No Bid
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